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INNER-CITY SCHOLARSHIP FUND AND JPMORGAN CHASE & CO. ANNOUNCE 
$1 MILLION SCHOLARSHIP ENDOWMENT IN MEMORY OF JIMMY LEE 

 
Endowment created by donation from JPMorgan Chase’s Foundation 

 
New York [July 13, 2015] – Inner-City Scholarship Fund and JPMorgan Chase & Co. today 
announced a $1 million scholarship endowment in memory of Jimmy Lee, the former Vice 
Chairman of JPMorgan Chase & Co. and former head of its Investment Bank, who passed away 
at the age of 62 in June. Jimmy was a devoted supporter of Inner-City’s mission to provide a 
quality Catholic school education to the children of New York.  
 
The endowment, known as the “Jimmy Lee Fund,” will be used to help cover tuition for eligible 
low-income students attending inner-city Catholic high schools within the Archdiocese of New 
York. Established by a $1 million donation from JPMorgan Chase’s foundation, the scholarship 
will be offered through Inner-City, New York City’s leading non-profit organization providing 
tuition assistance for students going to these schools. The endowment builds on donations 
already provided by Jimmy’s friends, family and colleagues to the Inner-City Scholarship Fund 
following his death.  
 
“Jimmy’s four decades of dedicated service go well beyond the walls of JPMorgan Chase,” said 
Jamie Dimon, Chairman and CEO, JPMorgan Chase & Co. “This scholarship fund is a tribute to 
Jimmy’s character, huge heart and generosity to those who were underprivileged or just needed a 
helping hand. It will provide future generations with a good education and the chance for a more 
hopeful future.”  
 
Jimmy’s dedication and generosity to Inner-City for over two decades enabled dozens of 
underserved children to attend and graduate from the city’s high-performing Catholic schools. 
He served on Inner-City’s Board of Trustees for six years and was an active member of the 
organization’s Development Committee. He also founded Inner-City’s Corporate Committee 
which has engaged countless New York City companies and raised millions of dollars in 
scholarship support. In 2010, Jimmy and his wife Beth served as chairs of Inner-City’s annual 
gala, which raised over $1 million. Most recently, in December 2014, Lee served as co-chair of 
Inner-City’s Award Dinner, raising a record $2.3 million for the organization. 
 
“Jimmy was a steadfast supporter and true friend of Inner-City,” said Susan George, Executive 
Director of Inner-City Scholarship Fund. “He is greatly missed, but we know his legacy and 
commitment to touching young lives will live on with this endowment.” 
 
Jimmy worked for JPMorgan Chase for nearly 40 years.  He passed away on June 17, 2015 and 
is survived by his wife Beth and three children.  Donations to the Jimmy Lee Fund can be made 
at www.innercityscholarshipfund.org/donate_jimmy_lee.cfm.   
 
About Inner-City Scholarship Fund 



Inner-City Scholarship Fund was founded in 1971 by the late Terence Cardinal Cooke and a 
group of prominent executives of many religious beliefs. Inner-City provides over $11 million in 
tuition assistance to more than 7,500 low-income elementary and high school students at 79 
inner-city Catholic schools in Manhattan, the Bronx and Staten Island. An impressive 98% 
percent of seniors attending inner-city Catholic high schools graduate, and 96% pursue college at 
some of the finest universities in the nation. 

About JPMorgan Chase & Co. 
JPMorgan Chase & Co. (NYSE: JPM) is a leading global financial services firm with assets of 
$2.6 trillion and operations worldwide. The Firm is a leader in investment banking, financial 
services for consumers and small businesses, commercial banking, financial transaction 
processing, and asset management. A component of the Dow Jones Industrial Average, 
JPMorgan Chase & Co. serves millions of consumers in the United States and many of the 
world's most prominent corporate, institutional and government clients under its J.P. Morgan and 
Chase brands. Information about JPMorgan Chase & Co. is available at 
www.jpmorganchase.com. 
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